
ANDHRA PRADESH ELECTRICITY REGULATORY COMMISSION
4th Floor, Singareni Bhavan, Red Hills, Hyderabad – 500 004

==================================================================
Amendment of General Terms and Conditions of Supply- Reduction of agreement period

from two years to one year – Approval - Issued.

- - -

Proceeding No. Secy/08/2015 Dated: 05-05-2015

Read the following:

1. Secy/01/2006 Dated: 06-01-2006

***

During the public hearings on the filings of Aggregate Revenue Requirement and

Retail Supply Tariffs held on 26-02-2015 at Guntur and on 04-03-2015 at Hyderabad,

Industrial Consumers’ Associations requested for reduction in duration of minimum period

of agreement from two years to one year.

While responding to the above request, on 04-03-2015 at Hyderabad, CMD,

APSPDCL on behalf of both DISCOMs stated that the DISCOMs have no objection for

reduction of agreement period from two years to one year.

Considering the request of the Consumers’ and the response of the DISCOMs, the

Commission felt that the amendment is required for the well being of the consumers and

hereby approves the following amendments to the “General Terms and Conditions of

Supply (GTCS)”, issued vide proceedings No: Secy/01/2006 Dated: 06-01-2006.

1) In clause 5.9.3.1, for the words “two years”, the words “one year” shall be

substituted.

2) In clause 5.9.3.2, for the words “two years”, the words “one year” shall be

substituted.

3) In clause 5.9.4.2, for the words “2 year period”, the words “one year period”

shall be substituted.

This Order is signed by the Andhra Pradesh Electricity Regulatory Commission on 5th May, 2015

(By Order of the Commission)

Dr. A. Sreenivas
Secretary (I/c.)


